City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 19, 2022
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Smith & Wesson 9MM M&P Handguns and Accessories for SAPD Officers and Other Law ProForce Marketing, Inc. GT Distributors, Inc. Range USA
Enforcement Officers
2625 Stearman Rd. Suite A |1124 New Meister LN, Suite (10870 Kenwood Rd.
6100015757 AAS 100
Prescot Pflugerville Cincinnati
Item Description Quantity AZ 86301 TX 78660 OH 45242
928-776-7192
A SAPD
1 Handgun-9mm Smith & Wesson M&P 9 M2.0 (17 Rounds NTS ACRO) 2800
Price Each $414.00 No Bid $425.99
Price Total $1,159,200.00) $1,192,772.00
11 Handgun Engraving “SAN ANTONIO POLICE DEPARTMENT 2800
Price Each $24.00 No Bid $0.00
Price Total $67,200.00
1.2 BuyBack Handgun-Smith & Wesson M&P 1.0, .40 Caliber 2100
Price Each -$210.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total -$441,000.00
1.3 BuyBack Handgun-Smith & Wesson M&P 2.0, .40 Caliber 180
Price Each -$240.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total -$43,200.00
A1 Subtotal SAPD Handguns (ltems # 1-1.3) $742,200.00, No Bid $1,192,772.00
2 Holster - Safariland SFL 6360RDS L-lIl for M&P 2.0 Right Hand 2500
Part # 6360RDS-2222- 131
Price Each $112.00 $129.89 $133.99
Price Total $280,000.00, $324,725.00 $334,975.00
3 Holster - Safariland SFL 6360RDS L-IIl for M&P 2.0 Left Hand 300
Part # 6360RDS-2222- 132
Price Each $112.00 $129.89 $139.99
Price Total $33,600.00 $38,967.00 $41,997.00
4 Weapon Light-Ultra High Output LED Light 1, X300U-B 2800
Part# X300U
Price Each $219.00 $235.53 $239.99
Price Total $613,200.00, $659,484.00 $671,972.00
A2 Subtotal SAPD Accessories (ltem #s 2-4) $926,800.00 $1,023,176.00 $1,048,944.00
B AVIATION
5 Handgun-9mm Smith & Wesson M&P 9 M2.0 (17 Rounds NTS ACRO) 60
Price Each $414.00 No Bid $425.99
Price Total $24,840.00 $25,559.40
5.1 Handgun Engraving “SAN ANTONIO AVIATION POLICE DEPARTMENT” 60
Price Each $24.00 No Bid $0.00
Price Total $1,440.00
5.2 BuyBack Handgun-Smith & Wesson M&P 2.0, .40 Caliber 42
Price Each -$240.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total -$10,080.00
B.A Subtotal AVIATION Handguns (ltem #s 5-5.2) $16,200.00 No Bid $25,559.40
6 Holster - Safariland SFL 6360RDS L-lll for M&P 2.0 Right Hand 52
Part # 6360RDS-2222- 131
Price Each $112.00 $129.89 $133.99
Price Total $5,824.00 $6,754.28 $6,967.48
7 Holster - Safariland SFL 6360RDS L-IIl for M&P 2.0 Left Hand 8
Part # 6360RDS-2222- 132
Price Each $112.00 $129.89 $139.99
Price Total $896.00 $1,039.12 $1,119.92
8 Weapon Light-Ultra High Output LED Light 1, X300U-B 60
Part# X300U
Price Each $219.00 $235.53 $239.99
Price Total $13,140.00 $14,131.80 $14,399.40
B.2 Subtotal AVIATION Accessories (ltem #s 6-8) $19,860.00 $21,925.20 $22,486.80




City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 19, 2022
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Smith & Wesson 9MM M&P Handguns and Accessories for SAPD Officers and Other Law ProForce Marketing, Inc. GT Distributors, Inc. Range USA
Enforcement Officers
2625 Stearman Rd. Suite A |1124 New Meister LN, Suite (10870 Kenwood Rd.
6100015757 AAS 100
Prescot Pflugerville Cincinnati
Item Description Quantity AZ 86301 TX 78660 OH 45242
928-776-7192
c PARKS
9 Handgun-9mm Smith & Wesson M&P 9 M2.0 (17 Rounds NTS ACRO) 203
Price Each $414.00 No Bid $425.99
Price Total $84,042.00 $86,475.97
9.1 Handgun Engraving “SAN ANTONIO PARKS POLICE”
Price Each 203 $24.00 No Bid $0.00
Price Total $4,872.00
9.2 BuyBack Handgun-Smith & Wesson M&P 2.0, .40 Caliber 142
Price Each -$240.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total -$34,080.00
(o] Subtotal PARKS Handguns (ltems # 9- 9.2) $54,834.00 No Bid $86,475.97
10 Holster - Safariland SFL 6360RDS L-lll for M&P 2.0 Right Hand 193
Part # 6360RDS-2222- 131
Price Each $112.00 $129.89 $133.99
Price Total $21,616.00 $25,068.77 $25,860.07
11 Holster - Safariland SFL 6360RDS L-IIl for M&P 2.0 Left Hand 10
Part # 6360RDS-2222- 132
Price Each $112.00 $129.89 $139.99
Price Total $1,120.00| $1,298.90 $1,399.90
12 Weapon Light-Ultra High Output LED Light 1, X300U-B 203
Part# X300U
Price Each $219.00 $235.53 $239.99
Price Total $44,457.00 $47,812.59 $48,717.97
Cc.2 Subtotal PARKS Accessories (Item #s 10-12) $22,955.00 $26,603.20 $75,977.94
D ARSON and RFT
13 Handgun-9mm Smith & Wesson M&P 9 M2.0 (17 Rounds NTS ACRO) 31
Price Each $414.00 No Bid $425.99
Price Total $12,834.00 $13,205.69
13.1 Handgun Engraving “SAN ANTONIO ARSON BUREAU”
Price Each 31 $24.00 No Bid $0.00
Price Total $744.00
13.2 BuyBack Handgun-Smith & Wesson M&P 2.0, .40 Caliber 21
Price Each -$240.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total -$5,040.00
DA Subtotal ARSON and RFT Handguns (Items # 13- 13.2) $8,538.00 No Bid $13,205.69
14 Holster - Safariland SFL 6360RDS L-IIl for M&P 2.0 Right Hand 30
Part # 6360RDS-2222- 131
Price Each $112.00 $129.89 $133.99
Price Total $3,360.00 $3,896.70 $4,019.70
15 Holster - Safariland SFL 6360RDS L-IIl for M&P 2.0 Left Hand 1
Part # 6360RDS-2222- 132
Price Each $112.00 $129.89 $139.99
Price Total $112.00 $129.89 $139.99
16 Weapon Light-Ultra High Output LED Light 1, X300U-B
Part# X300U 31
Price Each $219.00 $235.53 $239.99
Price Total $6,789.00 $7,301.43 $7,439.69
D.2 Subtotal ARSON and RFT Accessories (Item #s 14-16) $10,261.00 $11,328.02 $11,599.38




City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 19, 2022
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Smith & Wesson 9MM M&P Handguns and Accessories for SAPD Officers and Other Law ProForce Marketing, Inc. GT Distributors, Inc. Range USA
Enforcement Officers
2625 Stearman Rd. Suite A |1124 New Meister LN, Suite (10870 Kenwood Rd.
6100015757 AAS 100
Prescot Pflugerville Cincinnati
Item Description Quantity AZ 86301 TX 78660 OH 45242
928-776-7192
*BUYBACK PROGRAM MANAGEMENT
Administrative fee if applicable for managing the weapon Buyback Included At No Cost Per| No Bid No Bid
Program Each BuyBack|
17 SAPD - Smith & Wesson M&P 1.0, .40 Caliber 2,100 $0.00
18 SAPD - Smith & Wesson M&P 2.0, .40 Caliber 180 $0.00
19 PARKS - Smith & Wesson M&P 2.0, .40 Caliber 142 $0.00
20 AVIATION - Smith & Wesson M&P 2.0, .40 Caliber 42 $0.00
21 ARSON - Smith & Wesson M&P 2.0, .40 Caliber 42 $0.00
Warranty- Handguns 1 Year Limited No Bid No Bid
Warranty-Holsters 2 Years 2 Years No Bid
Warranty-Weapon lights SurefFire Lifetime Repair &|| SurefFire Lifetime Repair & N/A
Replacement| Replacement
Delivery- Handguns 90-120 Days No Bid 60-90 Days
Delivery-Holsters 90 Days 90 Days
Delivery-Weapon lights 45 Days 90 Days
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total $1,845,886.00 $1,130,609.48 $2,477,021.18
Total Award $1,845,886.00 Incomplete Incomplete
NOTE: *BUYBACK PROGRAM MANAGEMENT

Buyback total received by vendor will be applied as a discount itemized per Department to the City’s total cost of weapons purchased under this

contract. Estimated Quantities may be subject to change
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